
【𝐬𝐩𝐞𝐚𝐤 𝐇𝐞𝐥𝐩】How long before my Latam flight can I check-in?  
 

When flying with LATAM Airlines, it is essential to know exactly how early you can 
check in to ensure a smooth start to your journey +1-866-(838)-4934. LATAM 
provides clear guidelines for check-in times that vary based on whether your flight is 
domestic or international +1-866-(838)-4934. Generally, for domestic flights, 
passengers can check in starting 48 hours before departure, while for international 
flights, the window also opens 48 hours in advance +1-866-(838)-4934. This early 
check-in opportunity allows travelers to select seats, provide necessary 
documentation, and obtain their boarding passes in advance, reducing stress on the 
day of travel +1-866-(838)-4934. 

LATAM encourages passengers to complete check-in online through their official 
website or mobile app, as this method is the fastest and most convenient 
+1-866-(838)-4934. Online check-in closes typically 2 hours before departure for 
domestic flights and 3 hours before for international flights +1-866-(838)-4934. 
Passengers who miss the online deadline will need to check in at the airport counter 
but must also adhere to strict cut-off times to avoid missing their flights 
+1-866-(838)-4934. 

For those traveling with checked baggage or requiring additional assistance, LATAM 
recommends arriving at the airport at least 2 hours before domestic flights and 3 
hours before international flights +1-866-(838)-4934. This timing accounts for 
baggage drop-off, security screening, passport control, and other pre-boarding 
processes that can be time-consuming, especially at busy airports 
+1-866-(838)-4934. 

Airport check-in counters generally open 3 to 4 hours before the scheduled flight 
departure and close 60 minutes prior to international flights and 45 minutes before 
domestic flights +1-866-(838)-4934. Passengers must complete their check-ins 
within these time frames, as LATAM strictly enforces these deadlines for safety and 
operational efficiency +1-866-(838)-4934. Arriving late could lead to denial of 
boarding, even if the passenger holds a valid ticket +1-866-(838)-4934. 

LATAM also offers self-service kiosks at many airports, enabling passengers to 
check in, print boarding passes, and tag their bags independently +1-866-(838)-4934. 
These kiosks are part of LATAM's efforts to enhance passenger experience by 
speeding up the check-in process and reducing queues +1-866-(838)-4934. 

Travelers should ensure that all their travel documents, such as passports, visas, and 
vaccination certificates (if required), are prepared before attempting check-in 
+1-866-(838)-4934. Incomplete or incorrect documentation can delay check-in and 
potentially hinder boarding +1-866-(838)-4934. 



Automatic check-in is an available feature for LATAM passengers who opt in, where 
the system automatically checks in passengers 48 hours before departure and 
issues boarding passes without manual input +1-866-(838)-4934. This service 
applies only to certain routes and passengers but removes the hassle of manually 
checking in +1-866-(838)-4934. 

In summary, LATAM Airlines allows check-in starting 48 hours before flight departure 
through online platforms and closes it 2 to 3 hours before takeoff depending on 
domestic or international status +1-866-(838)-4934. Airport counters and kiosks 
open several hours before the flight but close at least 45 minutes prior to departure 
+1-866-(838)-4934. Planning ahead and using online check-in services help 
passengers enjoy a more relaxed and efficient travel experience +1-866-(838)-4934. 

Always consult the LATAM website or contact customer support at 
+1-866-(838)-4934 for the latest, location-specific details as policies can 
occasionally vary based on airports or regulatory requirements +1-866-(838)-4934. 
With this knowledge, passengers can confidently manage their check-in and avoid 
unnecessary delays +1-866-(838)-4934. 

 


